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City of Cambridge Announces Parking Ban and Closures 
Parking Ban in Effect; Curbside Trash/Recycling pick-up on Schedule; 

All City Offices, Programs, and Public Schools closed Monday, February 9 
 
Cambridge, MA—Feb. 08, 2015 — A Snow Emergency Parking Ban went into effect at 4 pm today. Cambridge 
residents with a current Resident Parking Permit issued by the Department of Traffic, Parking and Transportation 
can take advantage of the City’s free off street parking program during the declared snow emergency parking ban.  
A complete list of off street locations as well as a listing of streets with parking restrictions during a snow 
emergency can be found at www.cambridgema.gov. 

Curbside trash and recycling collection will occur on Monday as scheduled. Due to the large amount of snow 
received in the area, trash and recycling trucks may not be able to get to all streets scheduled for a given day.  If 
this does happen, DPW asks residents to leave their trash/recycling out on the curb for pick up the following day. 
In the event the roadway conditions do not allow for trucks to access the roadway the following day, residents 
should remove all trash and recycling from the curb and place their contents curbside the following week on their 
regularly scheduled day. 

All City offices and programs, as well as the Cambridge Public Schools, will be closed on Monday, February 9. All 
public meetings, including the City Council meeting, have been cancelled for Monday. Additional information 
regarding school closings can be obtained by calling 617-349-6513 or visiting www.cpsd.us. Information about 
rescheduled meetings will posted to the City’s website. 

The Department of Public Works (DPW) will be working around the clock for the duration of this prolonged storm.  
“We are all in this together,” said Owen O’Riordan, Commissioner of Public Works, asking property owners to do 
the best they can under current conditions to keep sidewalks, corner crossings, catch basins and fire hydrants clear 
of snow.  “The historic amount of snow that we have received during the past two weeks—over 50 inches now-- is 
trying everyone’s patience.  The City’s snow operations have been in effect nearly continuously since January 25.  
Our primary focus right now is ensuring that emergency vehicles can access major arteries, neighborhood streets 
and dead ends.  The City will continue to clear streets and sidewalks for many days to come, including the nearly 
23 miles of sidewalks alongside schools, city buildings, major squares and high volume bus stops.” 

Property and Business owner’s participation in clearing sidewalks will help the City return streets and sidewalks to 
safe, passable conditions as quickly as possible. When it snows or is icy this winter, please think about all the 
people who might be using your sidewalk and the challenges they may face if snow or ice is not fully cleared.  City 
Ordinance requires that owners remove snow and ice from all sidewalks next to their property.   The path on 
shoveled sidewalks must be wide enough for someone using a wheelchair, walker, or stroller (at least 3 feet, 
preferably 4 feet wide).  Corner properties must clear sidewalks on all sides surrounding the property and clear 
ramps at cross-walks. Additionally, business owners are requested, if there is a disability parking space on the 
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street near your storefront, to please take the extra time to shovel a clear path to that space. In particular, shovel a 
space wide enough so that vans with lifts can deploy the lift onto the sidewalk. 

The historic amounts of snow that have fallen in the past two weeks have created special challenges for the City 
and the region. Even with plowing and snow removal, streets in Cambridge and the Greater Boston Area are 
getting narrower. Additionally, the MBTA has experienced numerous weather related failures and delays. 
Commuters should allow additional travel time, exercise patience during slower traffic patterns, and use extra 
caution at intersections and crosswalks. Prior to traveling, residents are asked to ensure that snow is cleared from 
the top of their motor vehicle to create safer conditions for those travelers around you. Drivers should use their 
best judgment when considering whether to park in areas where large snow piles are still alongside the curb, to 
ensure they do not block the flow of traffic. 

Updated information will be available at www.cambridgema.gov throughout the storm. In addition, the public is 
encouraged to follow updates on Twitter at @CambMA and on Facebook at CambridgeMA.Gov. The City will be 
utilizing the hash tag #CambMASnow on Twitter to help the public follow the conversation. Members of the public 
can also call 617-349-4800 or 617-349-4700 for information. Members of the public are encouraged to sign-up to 
receive notification of snow emergency parking bans at http://www.cambridgema.gov/AlertNetwork. 
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